
Lysette Davi, Outstanding Graduate Student 
 
Known by countless students, faculty, and staff across campus through her many engagements, 
Lysette Davi is graduating this month with a Ph.D. in Higher Education. Throughout both her 
master’s and doctoral studies in the college, Davi has worked tirelessly as not only a student, 
but as a volunteer, advisor, committee member, and leader in many different capacities. As a 
result of her hard work and dedication, she has made significant, long-lasting contributions to 
both The University of Arizona and Tucson community at large.   
 
She is described by her former advisor as “motivated by service,” a deeply held value that has 
shaped her professional and academic work. Among her many impactful initiatives, she 
founded the college’s student government in response to student demands for more access to 
professional development, research, and social support. She also worked with the Associated 
Students of the University of Arizona and represented the university in Washington, DC to 
lobby for tuition decreases. Inspired by her previous experience working with the U.S. Peace 
Corps, Davi created the Honors College Alternative Spring Break program, which engages 
students with local communities through service-learning volunteer work.  
In response to the COVID-19 pandemic, she created a class, titled “How to Serve the 
Community During a Health Pandemic,” and, after working with the White Mountain Apache 
Tribe for six years, worked across campus to raise $3,000 to help their pandemic response 
efforts. 
 
As a student, Davi is curious, thoughtful, and highly dedicated to her work. This semester she 
successfully defended her dissertation, which involved examining online learning at the 
university’s microcampuses throughout the world. Her ability to weave together her personal, 
professional, and academic interests serves as a model to other graduate students, inspiring 
them to pursue meaningful academic and professional work.   
 
Lucky for the University, Davi is sticking around as both an HSI Fellow, with focus on access and 
equity in online learning, and as the Director of Honors Online and Experiential Learning. The 
college is so proud to call her the Fall 2020 Outstanding Graduate Student.  
 


